
The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, 
national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation.  Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO 

Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities 

(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

REVISED: 5/19/2017 

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

ITB #: 19-065B Tentative Board Meeting Date*: MAY 7, 2019 

ITB Title: SANITARY WASHROOM SUPPLIES # Notified: 442 # Downloaded:  40 

# of Responses Rec’d: 15 # of “No Bids”: 2 

For: DISTRICT-WIDE ITB Opening Date : 1/23/2019 

(School/Department)

Fund: SCHOOLS AND DEPARTMENTS BUDGETS Advertised Date: 12/18/2018 

POSTING OF ITB RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: Select One Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement & 

Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on _MARCH 19, 2019 @ 3:00 pm and will remain posted for 72 hours.  Any person who is adversely 

affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of decision or intended 

decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a notice of protest or 

failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that “The 

formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.” Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays and days during 

which the District is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall be at the office of the Director of 

Procurement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who files an action protesting 

an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward 

County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post the bond required by SBBC Policy 

3320, Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the right to protest. 

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB / RFP / RFQ / HARD BID, is in effect until it is approved by SBBC.  The Board meeting 

date stated above is tentative.  Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.  

REVISED RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

VENDORS NAME(S) GROUP(S) AWARDED 

PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY dba PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS PRIMARY: 1 (ITEMS A-E) 

DADE PAPER & BAG LLC dba IMPERIAL DADE ALTERNATE: 1 (ITEMS A-E) 

*RSD MAJESTIC SUPPLY COMPANY OF SOUTH FLORIDA, INC. PRIMARY: 2 (ITEMS A-C) 

SOUTH FLORIDA JANITORIAL & POOL SUPPLY, INC. ALTERNATE: 2 (ITEMS A-C) 

*NEELD PAPER AND SUPPLIES, INC. dba CITY MANAGEMENT SUPPLY
PRIMARY: 3 (ITEMS A-D) 

ALTERNATE: 4 

INTERLINE BRANDS, INC., dba SUPPLYWORKS (#1) ALTERNATE: 3 (ITEMS A-D) 

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP. PRIMARY: 4 

*CERTIFIED M/WBE VENDOR

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT THE ABOVE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATION, 

TERMS, AND CONDITIONS. 

IT IS ALSO RECOMMENDED THAT FOR THE REASONS STATED ON THE ATTACHED BID REJECTION SHEET, THE BIDS 

FOR THE ITEMS INDICATED BE REJECTED FOR NOT COMPLYING WITH THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE SOLICITATION. 

CONTRACT PERIOD: JUNE 22, 2019 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2021 

By: Larissa Seda Date: 2/27/2019 

(Purchasing Agent) 
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Bid No. 19-065B 

Sanitary Washroom Supplies 

Bid Rejection Sheet - Revised 

1. Reject Bid from Groupo GTE.  Bidder did not provide descriptive literature for equivalent proposed

items.  As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 11 – DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE: “If bidding

other than the make(s) and model(s) specified in this bid, it is required that complete descriptive

technical literature on the item being bid, be submitted with the bid and in time for bid opening.

Such literature shall be in sufficient detail to indicate conformance with the specifications of the

make(s) and model(s) specified in the bid.  Failure to provide this descriptive literature as indicated

shall result in disqualification of the bid submitted for the item.  Literature submitted must have the

bid item number stated on the upper right corner of the page”.

2. Reject Bid from All Florida Paper.  Bidder did not provide descriptive literature for equivalent proposed

items.  As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 11 – DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE: “If bidding

other than the make(s) and model(s) specified in this bid, it is required that complete descriptive

technical literature on the item being bid, be submitted with the bid and in time for bid opening.

Such literature shall be in sufficient detail to indicate conformance with the specifications of the

make(s) and model(s) specified in the bid.  Failure to provide this descriptive literature as indicated

shall result in disqualification of the bid submitted for the item.  Literature submitted must have the

bid item number stated on the upper right corner of the page”.  Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for

Group 1, no bid submitted for 1A. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 4 – AWARD: “….. 

For items in groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must 

meet specifications in order to be considered for award……” 

3. Reject Bid from M.C & M Construction Corp.  Bidder did not provide descriptive literature for

equivalent proposed items.  As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 11 – DESCRIPTIVE

LITERATURE: “If bidding other than the make(s) and model(s) specified in this bid, it is required that

complete descriptive technical literature on the item being bid, be submitted with the bid and in time

for bid opening.  Such literature shall be in sufficient detail to indicate conformance with the

specifications of the make(s) and model(s) specified in the bid.  Failure to provide this descriptive

literature as indicated shall result in disqualification of the bid submitted for the item.  Literature

submitted must have the bid item number stated on the upper right corner of the page”.

4. Reject Bid from The office Cart LLC.  Bidder did not provide descriptive literature for equivalent

proposed items.  As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 11 – DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE:

“If bidding other than the make(s) and model(s) specified in this bid, it is required that complete

descriptive technical literature on the item being bid, be submitted with the bid and in time for bid

opening.  Such literature shall be in sufficient detail to indicate conformance with the specifications of

the make(s) and model(s) specified in the bid.  Failure to provide this descriptive literature as

indicated shall result in disqualification of the bid submitted for the item.  Literature submitted

must have the bid item number stated on the upper right corner of the page”.  Bidder submitted an

incomplete bid for Group 1, no bid submitted for 1A. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 4

– AWARD: “….. For items in groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in 

the group must meet specifications in order to be considered for award……”
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Bid No. 19-065B 

Sanitary Washroom Supplies 

Bid Rejection Sheet - Revised 

Group 1: 

Reject Bid from Interline Brands, Inc., dba Supplyworks (#1 and #2).  Bidder provided incorrect pricing 

for Group Item 1.  As per the Bid’s General Condition 2 (Prices Quoted), Paragraph “b” (Mistakes):  

“Bidders are expected to examine the specifications, delivery schedules, bid prices and extensions, and all 

instructions pertaining to supplies and services.  Failure to do so shall be at Bidder’s risk.”   

Group 2: 

Reject Bid from Central Poly-Bag Corp.  Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 2. No bid submitted 

for item 2B. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 4 – AWARD: “….. For items in groups, it is 

necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications in order to 

be considered for award……” 

Reject Bid from Dade Paper & Bag LLC dba Imperial Dade.  Product sample provided for Item 2A did not 

meet specifications. Sample provided was too narrow.  Per Section 4: Special Conditions, 4. Award: “...all 

items in the group must meet specifications in order to be considered for award….” 

Group 3: 

Reject Bid from Interline Brands dba Supplyworks #2.  Product sample provided for Item 3A and 3C did 

not meet specifications.  In the sample provided by the Bidder, the two plies separated.  The bid specifies 

that plies must not separate and that separated plies shall result in disqualification of bid item.  Per Section 

4: Special Conditions, 4. Award: “...all items in the group must meet specifications in order to be considered 

for award.” 

Reject Bid from Central Poly-Bag Corp.  Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 3. No bid submitted 

for item 3B and 3D. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 4 – AWARD: “….. For items in groups, 

it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications in order 

to be considered for award……” 

Reject Bid from Edward Don & Company.  Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 3. No bid 

submitted for item 3B. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 4 – AWARD: “….. For items in 

groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications 

in order to be considered for award……” 

Reject Bid from Dade Paper & Bag LLC dba Imperial Dade.  Product sample provided for Item 3A and 3C 

did not meet specifications.  In the sample provided by the Bidder, the two plies separated.  The bid specifies 

that plies must not separate and that separated plies shall result in disqualification of bid item.  Per Section 

4: Special Conditions, 4. Award: “...all items in the group must meet specifications in order to be considered 

for award.” 
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Bid No. 19-065B 

Purchasing Agent: Edgar Lugo
Bid Title: Sanitary Washroom Supplies Bid Opened: 1/23/2019

Award 
(see 

legend)

Award 
(see 

legend)

Item Description Quantity Unit

 Bid Unit 

Price 

Bid Price 

Extension

 Bid Unit 

Price 

Bid Price 

Extension

1
1A Sanitary Napkins #8 450 CASE 31.19$           14,035.50$      31.190$     14,035.50$      
1B Sanitary Napkins #4 330 EACH 26.88$           8,870.40$       26.880$     8,870.40$        
1C Surface Mounted Sanitary Napkin Disposal 280 EACH 31.18$           8,730.40$       31.180$     8,730.40$        
1D DisposableUnit Liners, Wax Bags 600 CASE 13.01$           7,806.00$       13.010$     7,806.00$        
1E Dual Vending Dispenserfor Sanitary Napkins and Tampons 25 EACH 325.72$         8,143.00$       325.720$   8,143.00$        

TOTAL BID ITEM 1 (A-E INCLUSIVE) 47,585.30$      47,585.30$      

2
2A Hand Towel, White C-Fold 360,000,000 SHEET 0.00716$       2,577,600.00$ 0.00694$   2,498,400.00$ 

2B
Dispenser for C-Fold Hand Towel, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 900 EACH 32.46$           29,214.00$      32.46$       29,214.00$      

2C Towel, Roll Paper 3,000 CASES 21.670$         65,010.00$      20.38$       61,140.00$      
TOTAL BID ITEM 2 (A-C INCLUSIVE) 2,671,824.00$ 2,588,754.00$ 

3
3A Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced 2 Ply 66,000 CASES 25.70$           1,696,200.00$ 24.19$       1,596,540.00$ 

3B
Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue Dispenser, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 1,410 EACH 33.23$           46,854.30$      33.23$       46,854.30$      

3C Junior Size Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced, 2 Ply 6,000 CASES 17.74$           106,440.00$    21.51$       129,060.00$    
3D Dispenser, Jumbo Jr. Bathroom Tissue 160 CASES 30.59$           4,894.40$       30.59$       4,894.40$        

TOTAL BID ITEM 3 (A-D INCLUSIVE) 1,854,388.70$ A 1,777,348.70$ 

4 Facial Tissues, 2-Ply 6,000,000 SHEET 0.00518$       31,080.00$      0.00752$   45,120.00$      

REMARKS:

Recommend the award be made to the above low bidder(s) meeting specifications terms and conditions.

Interline Brands dba 

Supplyworks #1, Broward 

County, Florida

Interline Brands dba 

Supplyworks #2, Broward 

County, Florida

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA

BID TABULATION SHEET - REVISED

Award Legend   P=Primary Vendor  A=Alternate Vendor

Bids received were evaluated by: Edgar Lugo, Purchasing agent, Procurement & Warehousing Services, and Gerald Devio, Ben Osborne, Mark Murrray and Israel Canales, Custodial Supervisors, 
Physical Plant Operations
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Bid No. 19-065B

Purchasing Agent: Edgar Lugo
Bid Title: Sanitary Washroom Supplies Bid Opened: 1/23/2019

Award 
(see 

legend)

Award 
(see 

legend)

Item Description Quantity Unit

 Bid Unit 

Price 

Bid Price 

Extension

 5% Pref. 

Unit  Price 

Pref. Price 

Extension

 Bid Unit 

Price 

Bid Price 

Extension

1
1A Sanitary Napkins #8 450 CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1B Sanitary Napkins #4 330 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.10$         33.00$             
1C Surface Mounted Sanitary Napkin Disposal 280 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 31.50$       8,820.00$        
1D DisposableUnit Liners, Wax Bags 600 CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 13.10$       7,860.00$        
1E Dual Vending Dispenserfor Sanitary Napkins and Tampons 25 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 360.00$     9,000.00$        

TOTAL BID ITEM 1 (A-E INCLUSIVE) 25,713.00$      

2
2A Hand Towel, White C-Fold 360,000,000 SHEET 0.00681$       2,451,600.00$ 0.00715$     2,574,180.00$   0.00654$   2,354,400.00$ 

2B
Dispenser for C-Fold Hand Towel, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 900 EACH 40.00$           36,000.00$      42.00$         37,800.00$        25.26$       22,734.00$      

2C Towel, Roll Paper 3,000 CASES 18.66$           55,980.00$      19.59$         58,779.00$        19.23$       57,690.00$      
TOTAL BID ITEM 2 (A-C INCLUSIVE) 2,543,580.00$ 2,670,759.00$   2,434,824.00$ 

3
3A Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced 2 Ply 66,000 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 22.84$       1,507,440.00$ 

3B
Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue Dispenser, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 1,410 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.00$       15,510.00$      

3C Junior Size Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced, 2 Ply 6,000 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 20.51$       123,060.00$    
3D Dispenser, Jumbo Jr. Bathroom Tissue 160 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.00$       1,760.00$        

TOTAL BID ITEM 3 (A-D INCLUSIVE) 1,647,770.00$ 

4 Facial Tissues, 2-Ply 6,000,000 SHEET 0.00436$       26,160.00$      0.00458$     27,468.00$        0.00710$   42,600.00$      

REMARKS:

Recommend the award be made to the above low bidder(s) meeting specifications terms and conditions.

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA      

BID TABULATION SHEET - REVISED Groupo GTE, Clark County, Nevada

All Florida Paper, Miami-

Dade County, Florida

Award Legend   P=Primary Vendor  A=Alternate Vendor

Bids received were evaluated by: Edgar Lugo, Purchasing agent, Procurement & Warehousing Services, and Gerald Devio, Ben Osborne, Mark Murrray and Israel Canales, Custodial Supervisors, 
Physical Plant Operations
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Bid No. 19-065B

Purchasing Agent: Edgar Lugo
Bid Title: Sanitary Washroom Supplies Bid Opened: 1/23/2019

Award 
(see 

legend)

Award 
(see 
legend)

Item Description Quantity Unit

 Bid Unit 

Price 

Bid Price 

Extension

 5% Pref. 

Unit  Price 

Pref. Price 

Extension

 Bid Unit 

Price 

Bid Price 

Extension

1
1A Sanitary Napkins #8 450 CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1B Sanitary Napkins #4 330 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1C Surface Mounted Sanitary Napkin Disposal 280 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1D DisposableUnit Liners, Wax Bags 600 CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1E Dual Vending Dispenserfor Sanitary Napkins and Tampons 25 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID ITEM 1 (A-E INCLUSIVE)

2
2A Hand Towel, White C-Fold 360,000,000 SHEET 0.00537$       1,933,200.00$ 0.00564$     2,029,860.00$   0.00540$   1,944,000.00$ 

2B
Dispenser for C-Fold Hand Towel, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 900 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 31.92$       28,728.00$      

2C Towel, Roll Paper 3,000 CASES 18.50$           55,500.00$      19.43$         58,275.00$        19.25$       57,750.00$      
TOTAL BID ITEM 2 (A-C INCLUSIVE) 1,988,700.00$ 2,088,135.00$   2,030,478.00$ P

3
3A Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced 2 Ply 66,000 CASES 21.99$           1,451,340.00$ 23.09$         1,523,907.00$   NO BID NO BID

3B
Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue Dispenser, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 1,410 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3C Junior Size Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced, 2 Ply 6,000 CASES 19.99$           119,940.00$    20.99$         125,937.00$      NO BID NO BID
3D Dispenser, Jumbo Jr. Bathroom Tissue 160 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID ITEM 3 (A-D INCLUSIVE) 1,571,280.00$ 1,649,844.00$   

4 Facial Tissues, 2-Ply 6,000,000 SHEET 0.00432$       25,920.00$      0.00454$     27,216.00$        P NO BID NO BID

REMARKS:

Recommend the award be made to the above low bidder(s) meeting specifications terms and conditions.

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA      

BID TABULATION SHEET - REVISED Central Poly-Bag Corp., linden, New Jersey

RSD Majestic Supply 

Company of South Florida, 

Broward County, Florida

Award Legend   P=Primary Vendor  A=Alternate Vendor

Bids received were evaluated by: Edgar Lugo, Purchasing agent, Procurement & Warehousing Services, and Gerald Devio, Ben Osborne, Mark Murrray and Israel Canales, Custodial Supervisors, 
Physical Plant Operations
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Bid No. 19-065B

Purchasing Agent; Edgar Lugo
Bid Title: Sanitary Washroom Supplies Bid Opened: 1/23/2019

Award 
(see 

legend)

Award 
(see 
legend)

Item Description Quantity Unit

 Bid Unit 

Price 

Bid Price 

Extension

 Bid Unit 

Price 

Bid Price 

Extension

 5% Pref. 

Unit Price 

Pref. Price 

Extension

1
1A Sanitary Napkins #8 450 CASE NO BID NO BID 120.29$     54,130.50$      126.30$     56,837.03$        
1B Sanitary Napkins #4 330 EACH NO BID NO BID 0.16$         52.80$             0.17$         55.44$               
1C Surface Mounted Sanitary Napkin Disposal 280 EACH NO BID NO BID 42.32$       11,849.60$      44.44$       12,442.08$        
1D DisposableUnit Liners, Wax Bags 600 CASE NO BID NO BID 14.60$       8,760.00$        15.33$       9,198.00$          
1E Dual Vending Dispenserfor Sanitary Napkins and Tampons 25 EACH NO BID NO BID 437.91$     10,947.75$      459.81$     11,495.14$        

TOTAL BID ITEM 1 (A-E INCLUSIVE) 85,740.65$      90,027.68$        

2
2A Hand Towel, White C-Fold 360,000,000 SHEET 0.00700$       2,520,000.00$ 0.007$       2,368,800.00$ 0.007$       2,487,240.00$   

2B
Dispenser for C-Fold Hand Towel, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 900 EACH 33.19$           29,871.00$      32.670$     29,403.00$      34.304$     30,873.15$        

2C Towel, Roll Paper 3,000 CASES 21.05$           63,150.00$      19.330$     57,990.00$      20.297$     60,889.50$        
TOTAL BID ITEM 2 (A-C INCLUSIVE) 2,613,021.00$ 2,456,193.00$ 2,579,002.65$   

3
3A Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced 2 Ply 66,000 CASES NO BID NO BID 22.950$     1,514,700.00$ 24.098$     1,590,435.00$   

3B
Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue Dispenser, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 1,410 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3C Junior Size Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced, 2 Ply 6,000 CASES NO BID NO BID 20.400$     122,400.00$    21.420$     128,520.00$      
3D Dispenser, Jumbo Jr. Bathroom Tissue 160 CASES NO BID NO BID 34.450$     5,512.00$        36.173$     5,787.60$          

TOTAL BID ITEM 3 (A-D INCLUSIVE) 1,642,612.00$ 1,724,742.60$   

4 Facial Tissues, 2-Ply 6,000,000 SHEET 0.00750$       45,000.00$      0.00714$   42,840.00$      0.00750$   44,982.00$        

REMARKS:

Recommend the award be made to the above low bidder(s) meeting specifications terms and conditions.

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA 

BID TABULATION SHEET - REVISED
Rex Chemical Corporation. 

Miami-Dade, Florida Edward Don & Company. Chicago, Illinois

Award Legend   P=Primary Vendor  A=Alternate Vendor

Bids received were evaluated by: Edgar Lugo, Purchasing agent, Procurement & Warehousing Services, and Gerald Devio, Ben Osborne, Mark Murrray and Israel 
Canales, Custodial Supervisors, Physical Plant Operations
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Bid No. 19-065B

Purchasing Agent: Edgar Lugo
Bid Title: Sanitary Washroom Supplies Bid Opened: 1/23/2019

Award 
(see 

legend)

Award 
(see 
legend)

Item Description Quantity Unit

 Bid Unit 

Price 

Bid Price 

Extension

 Bid Unit 

Price Bid Price Extension

1
1A Sanitary Napkins #8 450 CASE 36.00$   16,200.00$   NO BID NO BID
1B Sanitary Napkins #4 330 EACH 25.00$   8,250.00$   30.10$   9,933.00$   
1C Surface Mounted Sanitary Napkin Disposal 280 EACH 24.00$   6,720.00$   33.60$   9,408.00$   
1D DisposableUnit Liners, Wax Bags 600 CASE 16.00$   9,600.00$   14.00$   8,400.00$   
1E Dual Vending Dispenserfor Sanitary Napkins and Tampons 25 EACH 235.00$   5,875.00$   410.00$   10,250.00$   

TOTAL BID ITEM 1 (A-E INCLUSIVE) 46,645.00$   37,991.00$   

2
2A Hand Towel, White C-Fold 360,000,000 SHEET 0.00580$   2,088,000.00$   18.50000$ 6,660,000,000.00$   

2B
Dispenser for C-Fold Hand Towel, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 900 EACH 25.00$   22,500.00$   55.00$   49,500.00$   

2C Towel, Roll Paper 3,000 CASES 25.00$   75,000.00$   21.50$   64,500.00$   
TOTAL BID ITEM 2 (A-C INCLUSIVE) 2,185,500.00$   6,660,114,000.00$   

3
3A Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced 2 Ply 66,000 CASES 20.25$   1,336,500.00$   42.00$   2,772,000.00$   

3B
Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue Dispenser, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 1,410 EACH 26.00$   36,660.00$   22.50$   31,725.00$   

3C Junior Size Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced, 2 Ply 6,000 CASES 28.00$   168,000.00$      25.50$   153,000.00$   
3D Dispenser, Jumbo Jr. Bathroom Tissue 160 CASES 34.00$   5,440.00$   89.00$   14,240.00$   

TOTAL BID ITEM 3 (A-D INCLUSIVE) 1,546,600.00$   2,970,965.00$   

4 Facial Tissues, 2-Ply 6,000,000 SHEET 2.50000$   15,000,000.00$ 21.50000$ 129,000,000.00$   

REMARKS:

Recommend the award be made to the above low bidder(s) meeting specifications terms and conditions.

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA

BID TABULATION SHEET - REVISED
M.C & M Construction Corp..

Broward County, Florida

The Office Cart LLC. Broward 

County, Florida

Award Legend   P=Primary Vendor  A=Alternate Vendor

Bids received were evaluated by: Edgar Lugo, Purchasing agent, Procurement & Warehousing Services, and Gerald Devio, Ben Osborne, 
Mark Murrray and Israel Canales, Custodial Supervisors, Physical Plant Operations
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Bid No. 19-065B

Purchasing Agent: Edgar Lugo

Bid Title: Sanitery Washroom Supplies Bid Opened: 1/23/2019

Award 
(see 

legend)

Award 
(see 
legend)

Item Description Quantity Unit

 Bid Unit 

Price 

Bid Price 

Extension

 Bid Unit 

Price 

Bid Price 

Extension

1
1A Sanitary Napkins #8 450 CASE 53.50$           24,075.00$      50.07$       22,531.50$      
1B Sanitary Napkins #4 330 EACH 31.80$           10,494.00$      28.74$       9,484.20$        
1C Surface Mounted Sanitary Napkin Disposal 280 EACH 47.50$           13,300.00$      33.79$       9,461.20$        
1D DisposableUnit Liners, Wax Bags 600 CASE 17.65$           10,590.00$      13.89$       8,334.00$        
1E Dual Vending Dispenserfor Sanitary Napkins and Tampons 25 EACH 600.00$         15,000.00$      396.62$     9,915.50$        

TOTAL BID ITEM 1 (A-E INCLUSIVE) 73,459.00$      59,726.40$      A

2
2A Hand Towel, White C-Fold 360,000,000 SHEET 0.00820$       2,952,000.00$ 0.00632$   2,275,200.00$ 

2B
Dispenser for C-Fold Hand Towel, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 900 EACH 38.50$           34,650.00$      34.39$       30,951.00$      

2C Towel, Roll Paper 3,000 CASES 23.25$           69,750.00$      20.63$       61,890.00$      
TOTAL BID ITEM 2 (A-C INCLUSIVE) 3,056,400.00$ 2,368,041.00$ 

3
3A Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced 2 Ply 66,000 CASES 41.50$           2,739,000.00$ 24.39$       1,609,740.00$ 

3B
Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue Dispenser, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 1,410 EACH 52.00$           73,320.00$      33.22$       46,840.20$      

3C Junior Size Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced, 2 Ply 6,000 CASES 37.45$           224,700.00$    21.69$       130,140.00$    
3D Dispenser, Jumbo Jr. Bathroom Tissue 160 CASES 44.50$           7,120.00$        36.06$       5,769.60$        

TOTAL BID ITEM 3 (A-D INCLUSIVE) 3,044,140.00$ 1,792,489.80$ 

4 Facial Tissues, 2-Ply 6,000,000 SHEET 0.01613$       96,780.00$      0.00762$   45,720.00$      

REMARKS:

Recommend the award be made to the above low bidder(s) meeting specifications terms and conditions.

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA 

BID TABULATION SHEET - REVISED
Glocecol LLC. Miami-Dade, 

Florida

Dade Paper & Bag LLC dba 

Imperial Dade. Miami-Dade, 

Florida

Award Legend   P=Primary Vendor  A=Alternate Vendor

Bids received were evaluated by: Edgar Lugo, Purchasing agent, Procurement & Warehousing Services, and Gerald Devio, Ben Osborne, 
Mark Murrray and Israel Canales, Custodial Supervisors, Physical Plant Operations
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Bid No. 19-065B

Purchasing Agent: Edgar Lugo
Bid Title: Sanitary Washroom Supplies Bid Opened: 1/23/2019

Award 
(see 

legend)

Award 
(see 
legend)

Item Description Quantity Unit

 Bid Unit 

Price 

Bid Price 

Extension

 Bid Unit 

Price 

Bid Price 

Extension

1
1A Sanitary Napkins #8 450 CASE NO BID NO BID 45.98$          20,691.00$     

1B Sanitary Napkins #4 330 EACH NO BID NO BID 25.05$          8,266.50$       

1C Surface Mounted Sanitary Napkin Disposal 280 EACH NO BID NO BID 29.82$          8,349.60$       

1D DisposableUnit Liners, Wax Bags 600 CASE NO BID NO BID 12.49$          7,494.00$       

1E Dual Vending Dispenserfor Sanitary Napkins and Tampons 25 EACH NO BID NO BID 344.98$        8,624.50$       

TOTAL BID ITEM 1 (A-E INCLUSIVE) 53,425.60$     P

2
2A Hand Towel, White C-Fold 360,000,000 SHEET 0.00671$       2,415,600.00$ NO BID NO BID

2B
Dispenser for C-Fold Hand Towel, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 900 EACH 33.55$           30,195.00$      NO BID NO BID

2C Towel, Roll Paper 3,000 CASES 21.05$           63,150.00$      NO BID NO BID
TOTAL BID ITEM 2 (A-C INCLUSIVE) 2,508,945.00$ A

3
3A Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced 2 Ply 66,000 CASES 24.95$           1,646,700.00$ NO BID NO BID

3B
Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue Dispenser, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 1,410 EACH 55.45$           78,184.50$      NO BID NO BID

3C Junior Size Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced, 2 Ply 6,000 CASES 22.10$           132,600.00$    NO BID NO BID
3D Dispenser, Jumbo Jr. Bathroom Tissue 160 CASES 42.15$           6,744.00$        NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID ITEM 3 (A-D INCLUSIVE) 1,864,228.50$ 

4 Facial Tissues, 2-Ply 6,000,000 SHEET 0.00770$       46,200.00$      NO BID NO BID

REMARKS:

Recommend the award be made to the above low bidder(s) meeting specifications terms and conditions.

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA 

BID TABULATION SHEET - REVISED

South Florida Janitorial & 

Pool Supply. Palm Beach 

County, Florida

Pyramid Paper Company 

dba Pyramid School 

Products. Hillsborough 

County, Florida

Award Legend   P=Primary Vendor  A=Alternate Vendor

Bids received were evaluated by: Edgar Lugo, Purchasing agent, Procurement & Warehousing Services, and Gerald Devio, Ben Osborne, 
Mark Murrray and Israel Canales, Custodial Supervisors, Physical Plant Operations
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Bid No. 19-065B

Purchasing Agent: Edgar Lugo

Bid Title: Sanitary Washroom Supplies Bid Opened: 1/23/2019

Award 
(see 

legend)

Item Description Quantity Unit

 Bid Unit 

Price 

Bid Price 

Extension

1
1A Sanitary Napkins #8 450 CASE NO BID NO BID
1B Sanitary Napkins #4 330 EACH NO BID NO BID
1C Surface Mounted Sanitary Napkin Disposal 280 EACH NO BID NO BID
1D DisposableUnit Liners, Wax Bags 600 CASE NO BID NO BID
1E Dual Vending Dispenserfor Sanitary Napkins and Tampons 25 EACH NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID ITEM 1 (A-E INCLUSIVE)

2 -$  
2A Hand Towel, White C-Fold 360,000,000 SHEET 0.00708$       2,548,800.00$ 

2B
Dispenser for C-Fold Hand Towel, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 900 EACH 38.68$           34,812.00$      

2C Towel, Roll Paper 3,000 CASES 21.44$           64,320.00$      
TOTAL BID ITEM 2 (A-C INCLUSIVE) 2,647,932.00$ 

3
3A Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced 2 Ply 66,000 CASES 25.40$           1,676,400.00$ 

3B
Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue Dispenser, Stainless Steel (No 
Enamel Finish) 1,410 EACH 31.98$           45,091.80$      

3C Junior Size Roll Toilet Tissue, Embraced, 2 Ply 6,000 CASES 17.60$           105,600.00$    
3D Dispenser, Jumbo Jr. Bathroom Tissue 160 CASES 26.95$           4,312.00$        

TOTAL BID ITEM 3 (A-D INCLUSIVE) 1,831,403.80$ P

4 Facial Tissues, 2-Ply 6,000,000 SHEET 0.00513$       30,780.00$      A

REMARKS:

Recommend the award be made to the above low bidder(s) meeting specifications terms and conditions.

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA

BID TABULATION SHEET - REVISED

Neeld Paper & Supplies, Inc. 

dba City Maintenance Supply. 

Broward County, Florida

Award Legend   P=Primary Vendor  A=Alternate Vendor

Bids received were evaluated by: Edgar Lugo, Purchasing agent, Procurement & Warehousing Services, and Gerald Devio, Ben 
Osborne, Mark Murrray and Israel Canales, Custodial Supervisors, Physical Plant Operations
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